
 

 

 

FRIDAY, FEBRUARY 12, 2016 
 

Items for publication must be submitted digitally by 12:00 PM, Thursday. 

 
And you shall love the Lord your God with all your heart 

and with all your soul and with all your mind and with all 
your strength.’ The second is this: ‘You shall love your 

neighbor as yourself.’ There is no other 
commandment greater than these.” 

Mark 12:30-31 
 

No School Monday! Enjoy the long weekend. 
 
THE YEARBOOK COMMITTEE NEEDS 

YOUR PHOTOS! We need pictures of class 
events, athletics, house events, and whole 

school gatherings, etc. Upload from your 
phone, computer, or dropbox using the 
following link: 

http://veritassavannah.smugmug.com/uploa
d/NtFPDL/veritasguestupload 

Keep snapping those photos! 
 
A TASTE OF THE CLASSICS:  Visit 

http://www.veritassavannah.org/support-
veritas/atotc2016/ to purchase your tickets. 

Invite friends, family, co-workers, neighbors, 
church members, etc.  Flyers are available in 
the office. Garibaldi’s and Collins Quarter 

tickets are already sold out.  
We are looking forward to a great evening! 

Desserts will be provided by Back in the Day 
Bakery, Gigi’s Cupcakes, Toucan Café, Byrd 

Cookie Co., and Chef Dave Hamer.   
We still need general auction items for our live 
auction.  Keep asking for donations!  

 
SHOUT OUT ON SOCIAL MEDIA: If you are 

active on Facebook, Twitter, Instagram, etc. 
please share our Taste of the Classics Event 
Page.  
https://www.facebook.com/events/953899024683753/ 
 
CONGRATULATIONS FIRST GRADE! They 

are the winners of the Pizza Party from the 
Taste of the Classics Committee.  

ENTERING THE BUILDING: If you need to 

enter the building during the school day, 
come to the awning door at the west end of 

the lane. Call the office, and we will let you in. 
The sanctuary doors are only open during 
carpool times.   

 
OPEN HOUSE: We had a great turn out for 

our first Open House. Please continue to 
spread the word for our next Open House,  
Thursday, February 25 at 9:00am. 

Promotional flyers are available in the office. 
 

BOX TOPS: This month’s collection deadline 
is Feb 19. The class with the most box tops 
collected will win a cookie party.  

 

Looking Ahead  . . . 

Feb 15 Mon No School Presidents’ Day 

Feb 16 Tue 6th & 7th Grade Variety Show 

Participants attend Drama 

1:45-3:00 

Feb 17 Wed Georgia Day Parade 3rd & 4th 

Graders Marching 

Feb 17 Wed 8th-12th Grade Variety Show 

Participants attend Drama 

1:45-3:00 

Feb 24 Wed 9AM Assembly, Third Grade 

Presents 

Feb 25 Thurs Open House 9AM 

Feb 26 Fri Jeans Day – Historical Figure 

Parent Coffee 

Feb29- 

Mar 4 

 Teacher Appreciation Week 

 
>>>>>>>>OVER for SPORTS NEWS>>>>>>>

RE-ENROLLMENT is ongoing! Returning 

families must complete their applications by 

March 1 to avoid paying the $100 application 

fee. All information is available on our 

website www.veritassavannah.org under the 

tab Admissions; menu item Returning 

Students. You can download the application 

and fill it out on your computer, then submit 

it to admissions@veritassavannah.org. Paper 

copies will be available in the office.      

http://veritassavannah.smugmug.com/upload/NtFPDL/veritasguestupload
http://veritassavannah.smugmug.com/upload/NtFPDL/veritasguestupload
http://www.veritassavannah.org/support-veritas/atotc2016/
http://www.veritassavannah.org/support-veritas/atotc2016/
http://www.veritassavannah.org/
mailto:admissions@veritassavannah.org


 

 

Sports & Student Life NEWS  
 

If you have not turned in fall sports uniforms, please place them in a bag with your name on it 

and turn into the office. 

Athanasius and Ambrose had 100% participation on the Class-ical Basket donations. Both 

houses received 100 points.  Great job! 

 

 Who?  When?  Where?  Notes  

Archery 

 

8th-12th grade 

 

 

5th-7th grade 

 

 

 

8th-12th grade & 

qualifying 5th-7th 

grade archers 

 

8th-12th grade & 

qualifying 5th-7th 

grade archers 

Practice: T &TH, Feb.16 & 18 

1:45-3:30 

 

Practice: F, Feb.  19  

1:45-3:30 

 

 

NASP State Tournament: 

March 4 

Flights TBD 

 

GICAA State Tournament: 

March 12, Flights TBD 

Greek Orthodox 

 

 

Greek Orthodox 

 

 

 

Perry,GA 

 

 

 

Statesboro, GA 

5th -7th grade: No 

practice on Mon. 

due to school 

holiday, you are 

welcome to 

attend Tues or 

Thurs. as your 

schedule allows.  

 

 

 

 

 

 


